‘ 4 1 [‘t Purchase Order PO0003269
Homes (2019) Limited
210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
OC FLOORING Site: SHEA VILLAGE
1449 YOUVILLE DRIVE Lot/Unit: BLOCK A05
ORLEANS, ONTARIO K1C 4R1 Model: 110 REVERSED
Civic: 1134 COPE DRIVE
tel: 613-837-9373
fax:
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Feb 11, 2025 . ARIEL 001 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
S QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
020-A05-666 CODE 666 REPAIR CARPET DAMAGE AT FINISHED 1.0000 415.520000 415.52
BASEMENT REC. ROOM
SEE ATTACHED INVOICE #131882
Subtotal 415.52
M-———-—-‘ HST 54.02
7%
76thori[éd Signature Total Order Value 469.54

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliverios accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT



OC FLOORING ORLEANS
1449 Youville Drive

@FLOORING OTTAWA, Ontario K1C 4R1
 C Téléphone/Phone : 613-837-9373

sales@ocflooring.com

FACTURE
INVOICE
131882

Invoice date February 4, 2025

FACTURE A/INVOICED TO EXPEDIE A/SHIPPED TO :

VALECRAFT HOMES (2019) LIMITED
210-1455 YOUVILLE DRIVE
OTTAWA (Ontario), K1C6Z7

Client/Customer : Valecraft homes (2019) limited

1134 COPE DRIVE STITTVILLE
A-05 SHEA VILLAGE

No du client/Customer Number Vendeur/Sales Person Taxes
61383711042019 Julie Pelletier 123069122 1220337240
No de commande/Order No. Expédié par/Picked By Licence R.B.Q.
5668-3568-01
Date requise/Required Date Notre référence/Reference No. Conditions/Terms
February 3, 2025 52546 Net 30 day(s)
CODE DESCRIPTION PRIXUNIT. ESC PRIXDE VENTE TOTAL
UNIT PRICE DISC SELLING PRICE TOTAL
01 A4525 MINOTAUR 84558 BEACH SHELL $20.69 $20.69 $165.52
Note : DYE LOT 285786
02 MISCELLANEOUS LABOUR $250.00 $250.00 $250.00
Note : REPAIR CARPET IN THE REC ROOM.RE USE PAD THAT IS ON SITE. PO WORK.. SITE REQUEST FROM SERGEI..
03 A4525 MINOTAUR 84558 BEACH SHELL
Note : DYE LOT 285786
04 MISCELLANEOUS LABOUR
Note : RE/RE THE FULL CARPET IN THE BASEMENT DUE TO THE REPAIR WASN'T MATCHING THE DYE LOT
NO RETURNS ON 3PECIAL ORDERS
SOUS-TOTAL/SUB TOTAL : $415.5
THAVE RECEIVED MY WARRANTY AND MAINTENANCE DOCUMENTS HS.T.: $54.0
TOTAL : $469.5
IHAVE RECEIVED MY INSTALLATION PREPARATION BOOKLET
SIGNATURE : DATE : A PAYER/DUE : $469.5




Purchase Orders

From: Sergei Muller

Sent: Tuesday, February 4, 2025 9:17 AM

To: Purchase Orders

Subject: Fwd: REF52546-Looking for PO-1134 COPE DRIVE STITTVILLE A0S

Hi Ariel please see email attached and help me outwit this. Work was done
Repair needed because site damage.

Sergei Muller

Site Foreman Rathwell Landing

Tel: 613-581-5434

Email: smuller@valecraft.com

B

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 677

Begin forwarded message:

From: Julie Pelletier <jPelletier@ocflooring.com>

Date: February 4, 2025 at 09:06:08 EST

To: Sergei Muller <smuller@valecraft.com>

Cc: Todd Briscoe <tbriscoe@ocflooring.com>

Subject: REF52546-Looking for PO-1134 COPE DRIVE STITTVILLE A05

Hi Sergei,

We have done the carpet repairs at this lot. Caniget a PO so i can send this over to
accounting?

Thanks,

Julie Pelletier
Customer Service Coordinator



OC Flooring

Serving the Ottawa region since 1987

P.(613) 837-9373 X 110

https://link.edgepilot.com/s/d00c3309/ail aGysj0 4H2ikxtsvdQ?u=http://www.o/cfl
ooring.com




