t “ 7 1 [‘t Purchase Order P0O0003087
Homes (2019) Limited
210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone:  613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
RIVARD MECHANICAL LIMITED Site: SHEA VILLAGE
101 - 1455 YOUVILLE DRIVE Lot/Unit: BLOCK B06-B07-B08-B09
ORLEANS, ONTARIO K1C 627 .
Model:
Civic: COPE DRIVE
tel: 613-837-2600
fax:
contact: CARRIE-ANNE DOLAN
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Sep 24, 2024 ARIEL RO1 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
o QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
020-B06-051 CODE 051 EXTRA LABOUR SOIL CONDITION 1.0000 157.500000 157.50
COMPACTED BLOCK B06
020-B07-051 CODE 051 EXTRA LABOUR SOIL CONDITION 1.0000 157.500000 157.50
COMPACTED BLOCK B07
020-B08-051 CODE 051 EXTRA LABOUR SOIL CONDITION 1.0000 157.500000 157.50
COMPACTED BLOCK B08
020-B09-051 CODE 051 EXTRA LABOUR SOIL CONDITION 1.0000 157.500000 157.50
COMPACTED BLOCK B09
s Subtotal 630.00
‘/\:/s‘»_ HST 81.90
<= .,% :
Auth/(nzed S,(qnature Total Order Value 711.90

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




EMPLOYEE

HOURS
TIME
REGULAR
TICKET NAME D ld“\,& I R.O. #
IME 1 1/2
F DAJ%L:T/ DOUBLE TIME

RILAlRID
/M CHANICAL

JoBINvoicE (08087

ﬂUST. ORDER NO DAY WORK D DATE ORDERED ’7 / \
1455 Youville Drive I &f ’3 )/70 4/"{/
Orleans, Ontario K1C 627 NIGHT WORK Ml
837-2600 SUPPLIER INV. NO
WEEKEND ]

/ TIME ARRIVED CHARGE D
INVOICE TO \vf VB Z AT To)d FESE CASH ]
ADDRESS TRAVELLING CHEQUE E]
CITY PHONE TRUCK CHARGE CREDIT CARD D

JOB NAME & LOCATION g V 4— (/K JOB NO. CONTRACT D
DESCRIPTION OF WORK — Fg
| _.4&:@4_14&&%@_@&2_ MINIMUM
N0 Aol CanpiTion): (OMP4CTED. CHARGE
' 57 I

QUANT.

DESCRIPTION OF MATERIALS USED

UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

TOTAL

<t
t

CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE

DOUBLE TIME 9 PM.TO 6 A.M.
DOUBLE TIME SATURDAY, SUNDAY & HOLIDAYS
@UCK CHARGE $ .00

UNPAID BALANCE
AFTER 30 DAYS

<

MECH. sIG. X

Widudd

ey

HOURS TOTAL MATERIALS ,
- .
i MECH. @ q¢. $C Syac FRONT \ NIR
TOTAL MATERIALS /
HELP @ X BACK
HOURLY RATE TERMS | FIND THE TIME CHARGED ABOVE AND THE WORK
$ 2% PER MONTH PERFORMED ARE SATISFACTORY. | AGREE TO PAY FOR - '?LMLA — T,‘ (o %C L
REGULAR 8 AMTO 5 PM. CHARGED ON SAME ON RECEIPT OEINVQICE. - ST
TIME 1 1/2 5 PM.TO 9 PM. HA ANY “ ARGE

TOTAL AMOUNT




T SR mEEEVY U Y W e

/M CHANICAIL

Suite 101, 1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, Ontario K1C 677

Number: IN36442
Sold VALECRAFT VH2019 THS Page: 1
To: SHEA VILLAGE SV PH1 Date: 9/13/2024
1455 YOUVILLE DRIVE, STE. 210
ORLEANS, ON K1C 627
CAN
Contract No:  R01-020 Customer Reference #: JI#8087
Lot Date [Description/Comments Doc # Qty Unit Price Amount
B00O 09/13/2024 |JI#8087-Extra labour due to soil JI#8087 1 630.00 630.00
condition:compacted
Lab- 7Hrs @ $90/Hr=$630 (As Per Jeff J.)
/ / |
o
¥ >
//J 1
Total Billing 630.00
HST 81.90
Total amount
Amount Owing 711.90

NCE CHARGE OF 2% PER MONTH ON OVERDUE ACCOUNTS AFTER 30 DAYS.
FRAIS DE 2% PAR MOIS SUR LES COMPTES ECHUS APRES 30 JOURS.

TEL: (613) 837-2600 FAX: (613) 824-7483

GST NO.: 10625-5615-RT



Purchase Orders

From: Alex Beckett

Sent: Monday, September 16, 2024 11:23 AM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Jeff Jasmann

Subject: FW: IN36442-J1#8087-Extra Labour SV1-Block B
Attachments: IN36442)1#8087 .pdf

Ariel, if Jeff approved this please write the PO.

Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

%] Valecraft

Homes (2019) Limited

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627

Tel (613) 837-1104 x 219
Mobile 613-868-8403
website

00

From: Carrie-Anne Dolan <cadolan@rivardm.com>
Sent: September 16, 2024 11:21 AM

To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>
Subject: IN36442-JI1#8087-Extra Labour SV1-Block B

Good morning,

Please find attached invoice# IN36442/JI1#8087 for the extra labour in SV1 Block B. This will be included in the
invoices dropped off this afternoon.

Have a nice day!

Regards,

Carrie-Anne Dolan

Office and Accounting Manager
Rivard Mechanical

1455 Youville Drive

Suite 101, Orleans

ON, K1C 6Z7 613-837-2600
cadolan@rivardm.com




