& Valecraft

Homes (2019) Limited

210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone:  613-837-1104

Purchase Order

PO0002751

Vendor: Ship To:
HARDING MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS INC Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 7
200 NIPISSING COURT Lot/Unit: LOT 7
KANATA, ONTARIO K2T ON7 Model: 826 REVERSED
Civic: 902 COLOGNE STREET
tel: 613-831-2257
fax:
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Feb 05, 2024 ARIEL HO1 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
e QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
067-007-680 #75 REFER CONSTR. SUMMARY ITEM#75 1.0000 395.850000 395.85
REDESIGN KITCHEN AT STOVE
Subtotal 395.85
HST 51.46
(/ Authorized Sianature ‘ Total Order Value 447.31

2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL
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Purchase Orders

From: Alex Beckett
Sent: Monday, February 5, 2024 2:28 PM
To: Purchase Orders
Subject: FW: Quote request
c8n #7S

Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

) Valecraft

Homes (2019) Limited

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627

Tel (613) 837-1104 x 219
Mobile 613-868-8403
website

From: Amanda Noble <anoble@teamhardingcomfort.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2024 2:29 PM

To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Subject: RE: Quote request

Hi Alex,
| apologize for the delay. the cost would be. $395.85

Thank You, Have a Great Day!

Amanda Harding-Noble Direct Line: 343-308-2747
Builder Relation Development anoble@teamhardingcomfort.com
teamhardingcomfort.com

C  TEAM Harding... Your Source for Total Home Comfort

Hmrfjmq G

From: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2024 1:58 PM

To: Amanda Noble <anoble@teamhardingcomfort.com>
Subject: RE: Quote request

Sorry to bother. Any development on this quote?

Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager



