Homes Ltd.
210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
DEVON PLUS COMPANY INC. Site:
3581 CALABOGIE ROAD Lot/Unit:
BURNSTOWN, ONTARIO K0J 1G0 Model:
odel:
Civic:

tel: 613-277-8349
fax:
contact: Christine Reid (Hunter) hunterch4@outlook.com

Valecraft ™ ™

RATHWELL LANDING PHASE 1

LOT 236
825

670 PARADE DRIVE

ORDER DATE

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliverios accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Jan 29, 2024 ARIEL D16 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
- QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
- 6600-5600 CLEANING MODEL HOME IN AUGUST 2023 1.0000 300.000000 300.00
- 6600-5600 CLEANING MODEL HOME DATED ON 4.0000 125.000000 500.00
SEPTEMBER 8, 15, 21, 28
- 6600-5600 CLEANING MODEL HOME DATED ON 4.0000 125.000000 500.00
OCTOBER 5, 13, 20, 27
- 6600-5600 CLEANING MODEL HOME DATED ON 5.0000 125.000000 625.00
NOVEMBER 2, 10, 16, 23, 30
- 6600-5600 CLEANING MODEL HOME DATED ON 3.0000 125.000000 375.00
DECEMBER 1, 8, 15
e Subtotal 2,300.00
/@// HST 299.00
Authorized Signature Total Order Value 2,599.00

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




FIELD REQUEST FORM 2021

\‘ Work Order : Ochek

V aeaft Purchase Order : Do

Homea Td. DC fﬁ) ftice Of Bag Charge : Ooex
Trade : a “Ss > MOLM
A { /
Lot/ Unit:
Project Site :
Date Issued :

(Not being Back Charged) [ check Vandalism Damage : ik

Theft : Ocwex | Trade Related Damage : [ Check
Reported to Police Yes : :

Police Department :
Police Report :
Police Occurrence No. :

| i Check

Back Charge To :
Notification Given To :

Date Notified Trade :

Notice Given By :

Repair Work Preformed By :

Note (1) : Should you wish to deal directly with the repair contractor, he must issue
written confirmation to Valecraft Homes Ltd that he has received Payment.

Note (2) : Contractor acknowledges that unless contested, the aforementioned amount's
back charged will be deducted off your next cheque.

Site Foreman Approval: g) . 1/4,,,‘ //,e_/\’

Const. Manager Approval:




Purchase Orders

From: Christine Hunter <hunterch4@outlook.com>

Sent: Sunday, December 17, 2023 2:45 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Andrea Pepler

Subject: PO request forms

Attachments: clean model home.pdf; Sept model home.pdf; October model home.pdf; November

model home.pdf; December model home.pdf

Hello,
Please see attached PO requests forms...

Thank You!
Christine



\'¢
Work Order Ochecx

Purchase Order: Do
\u/ugslme Craft /> Mce Of Back/Charge: Dicres
. Sub Trade: / gUbi/\ S § Ww

Lot / Unit:
Project:
Date:

-, - .. Description of Work or Material Being Ordered : Amount:
/[ / P /]
“Cllan Mo del A e

Z g ~

Sipt XIS, 77 ing 73 | Sope

O7Z8 iotry

Reason & Cause Due To for.Work Being Done or Material Ordered ;-

*** Note: Reason & Cause information mandafory for Purchase Orders**

| Total Amount 5 had
Cost Responsibility:
Errors Internal ;[ B Construction Damage ;| . A
(Not being Back Charged) O oneek Vandalism Damage : Olcheck
Theft ; ' Oo=x | Trade Related Damage : Dlcheck
Reported to Police Yes : Cloneck

Police Department :
Police Report :

Police Occurrence No. :

Back Charge To :

Notification Given To :

Date Notified Trade :

Notice Given By :

Repair Work Preformed By :

Note (1) : Should you wish to deal directly with the repair contractor, he must issue
written confirmation to Valecraft Homes Lid that he has received Payment.
Note (2) : Contractor acknowledges that unless contested, the aforementioned amount's




Purchase Orders

From: Christine Hunter <hunterch4@outlook.com>

Sent: Sunday, December 17, 2023 2:45 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc Andrea Pepler

Subject: PO request forms

Attachments: clean model home.pdf; Sept model home.pdf; October model home.pdf; November

model home.pdf; December model home.pdf

Hello,
Please see attached PO requests forms...

Thank You!
Christine



FIELD REQUEST FORM 2019
Work Order O

Valecraﬂ Purchase Order; Dcnex

Homes Ltd. W Of Back/Gharge: Dichex
. Sub Trade: D@ Von &éﬁ NPty
v 7

Lot / Unit:
Project:
Date:
.. Description of Work or Material Being Ordered : Amount:
A et %B\{\AL
C(ean _ IWd L
oo . (| P W /) =
A piiiey Ul | A8 oy SR 5
e _ / % @ 2SS Ar/
Reason & Cause Due To for Work Being Done or Material Ordered :
*** Note: Reason & Cause information mandatory for Purchase Orders™* =
| Total Amount 500D

Cost Responsibility:

) Errors Internal:| =~ Construction Damage 3|
(Not being Back Charged) L check Vandalism Damage : Clchek
Theft : ' Oaoek | Trade Related Damage : Dlcteck
Reported to Police Yes : Cicneck
Police Department :
Police Report :

Police Occurrence No. :

Back Charge To :

Notification Given To :

Date Notified Trade :

Notice Given By :

Repair Work Preformed By :

Note (1) : Should you wish fo deal directly with the repair contracior, he must issue
written confirmation to Valecraft Homes Lid that he has received Payment.

Note (2) : Contractor acknowledges that unless contested, the aforementioned amount's
back charged will be deducted off your next cheque.

Site Approval: 4 /\X/—« / ['é../‘

Head Office Approval:




Purchase Orders

From: Christine Hunter <hunterch4@outlook.com>

Sent: Sunday, December 17, 2023 2:45 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Andrea Pepler

Subject: PO request forms

Attachments: clean model home.pdf; Sept model home.pdf; October model home.pdf; November

model home.pdf; December model home.pdf

Hello,
Please see attached PO requests forms...

Thank You!
Christine



{orxsed

FIELD REQUEST FORM 2019

Work Order Dchex
Purchase Order: Omex

Valecraft

Homes Lud. e Of Bac har ©: Cicneck
Sub Trade: ’D‘QVDK\ ?Zr IWM
Lot / Unit:
Project:
Date:
- Description of Work or Material Being Ordered : Amount:
Va I | I /
I WSO AL AN | 2>
A (N, \ P L )/ ANE. ) \g
N e 2 [0 o }35 30| 52F
/ |\ QF[2T lryy |
- Reason & Cause Due To for Work Being Done or Materlal Ordered:
-

*** Note: Reason & Cause information mandatory for Purchase Orders™*

[ Total Amount
Cost Responsibility:
. Errors Internal : Construction Damage :
(Not being Back Charged) [ check Vandalism Damage : Ccheck
Theft : Uae | Trade Related Damage : Dcheck
Reported to Police Yes : Check

Police Department :

Police Report :

Police Occurrence No. :

Back Charge To :

Notification Given To :

Date Notified Trade :

Notice Given By :

Repair Work Preformed By :

Note (1) : Should you wish to deal directly with the repair contractor, he must issue
written confirmation to Valecraft Homes Ltd that he has received Payment.
Contractor acknowledges that unless contested, the aforementioned amount's

back charged will be deducted off your next cheque.

Note (2) :

Site Approval:

S A flen

Head Office Approval:




Purchase Orders

From: Christine Hunter <hunterch4@outlook.com>

Sent: Sunday, December 17, 2023 2:53 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Andrea Pepler

Subject: Nov - Dec model home cleaning

Attachments: Revised - Dec model cleaning.pdf; Revised - November model cleaning.pdf
Hi,

Please note | just revised the amount on the attached PO request form with the correct amount.

Thanks
Christine



KaVised

FIELD REQUEST FORM 2019
[J Work Order Do~
Purchase Order: Ocnec
Ygslme Craﬁ Of Back,Charge: Ocnex
. Sub Trade: D/{‘/V/)]g/ //"f f ”@1,(,/

Lot / Unit:
Project: //Aq DEf /7?14% A/’/’ WIEL/N
Date:
. Description of Work or Material Being Ordered : Amount
OFF7 ¢ & /’/W/ ng 245

DEc /, /MP F DZe /374 @”//)

7

Reason & Cause Due To for Work Being Done or Material Ordered :

*** Note: Reason & Cause information mandatory for Purchase Orders™*

[ Total Amount_

Cost Responsibility:

_ Errors Internal | , Construction Damages| L
(Not bemgBack Charged) [l G Vandalism Damage : [lCheck
Theft : ' Qae | Trade Related Damage : Dlcheck
Reporied to Police Yes : [check
Police Department :
Police Report :

Police Occurrence No. :

Back Charge To :

Notification Given To :

Date Notified Trade :

Notice Given By :

Repair Work Preformed By :

Note (1) : Should you wish to deal directly with the repair contractor, he must issue
written confirmation to Valecraft Homes Lid that he has received Payment.

Note (2) : Contractor acknowledges that unless contested, the aforementioned amount's
back charged will be deducted off your next cheque.

Site Approval: g Aic, (i [os/\

Head Office Approval:




Purchase Orders

From: Christine Hunter <hunterch4@outlook.com>

Sent: Sunday, December 17, 2023 2:53 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Andrea Pepler

Subject: Nov - Dec model home cleaning

Attachments: Revised - Dec model cleaning.pdf; Revised - November model cleaning.pdf
Hi,

Please note | just revised the amount on the attached PO request form with the correct amount.

Thanks
Christine



