210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627

Valecraft

Homes (2019) Limited

Purchase Order

PO0002400

Phone:  613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
HARDING MECHANICAL CONTRACTORS INC Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 7
200 NIPISSING COURT Lot/Unit: BLOCK A01
KANATA, ONTARIO K2T ON7 Model: 105 REVERSED
Civic: 950 COLOGNE STREET
tel: 613-831-2257
fax:
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Jul 27, 2023 ARIEL HO1 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
I QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
067-A01-666 CODE 666 REPAIR KITCHEN FAN ROUGH-IN 1.0000 80.000000 80.00
Subtotal 80.00
W HST 10.40
//Autyérized Signature Total Order Value 90.40

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




Purchase Orders

From: Justin Stoll

Sent: Tuesday, July 18, 2023 10:00 AM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: HM Service; Joe Sullivan; HM Dispatch

Subject: Re: Valecraft embrun A1 - 950 Cologne St. Embrun
Hi Ariel,

Can you write up a po for $80+hst to Harding for a repair | need done? Damage unknown. Please reply all when done.

o

Thanks

Justin Stoll 4

Foreman Z
Valecraft 2019 Embrun
613-809-2654

OnJul 18, 2023, at 9:41 AM, lan Kolesnik <ikolesnik@valecraft.com> wrote:
Joe,
Kirk is no longer with Valecraft, | have attached Justin who is now in charge or Embrun.

Thanks,
lan

On Jul 18, 2023, at 8:57 AM, Joe Sullivan <jsullivan@teamhardingcomfort.com> wrote:

See below. | will require a PO for $80.00 + HST to repair this. Once received | will
schedule service.

Thank you,
e\ 'EAM Direct Line: 343-308-2767
{:‘"} %""!ffﬁrﬁﬂﬁf”\ﬁj jsullivan@teamhardingcomfort.com
o teamhardingcomfort.com

Joe Sullivan
Construction Coordinator

Harding... Your Source for Total Home Comfort

From: Invirocaire



Sent: Tuesday, July 18, 2023 7:09 AM
To: HM Service <hmservice@teamhardingcomfort.com>
Subject: Valecraft embrun Al

Kitchen fan rough in is crushed in bulkhead. Left the boot

Sent from the all new AOL app for iOS




