&) Valec

ft Purchase Order PO0051821

Homes Ltd.
210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
JACQUES BEDARD EXCAVATION LTD. Site: CARDINAL TRAIL PHASE 5
3006 TENTH LINE ROAD Lot/Unit: BLOCK F29-F30-F31-F32-F33-F34
NAVAN, ON. K4B 1H8 g
Model:
Civic: BRASSEUR CRESCENT
tel: 6138243208
fax:
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Apr 11, 2023 ARIEL BO1 NET 60 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
i g QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
037-F29-703 CODE 703 WINTER HANDLING BLOCK F29 41.0800 0.250000 10.27
037-F30-703 CODE 703 WINTER HANDLING BLOCK F30 41.0800 0.250000 10.27
037-F31-703 CODE 703 WINTER HANDLING BLOCK F31 41.0800 0.250000 10.27
037-F32-703 CODE 703 WINTER HANDLING BLOCK F32 41.0800 0.250000 10.27
Subtotal 41.08
\% / HST 5.34
y/A
7(@07’ ed Signature Total Order Value 46.42

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




March 31,2023
ORDERNO: __ - _____ DATE;

Jacques Bédard ) 500 Tenth Line Rd CHARGE TO: Ya'gcr a_ﬁ . o
Excavation Ltd. B
SINCE 1969 Ottawa’ ON
K4B 1H8 -

R o TEL: o
Locanol Cardinal Trails
TIME TIME #OF $ PER
TYPE OF EQUIPMENT STARTED | FINISHED | HOURS | HOUR EXTENSION
Winter Handling as per Quarry :
Blk F GA 164.33 25 $41.08
-H ST #102557337
G TOTAL
X
WE REGRET WE CANNOT ASSUME RESPONSIBLITY FOR PROPERTY DAMAGE WHEN

JB Cp-Q 1 6 ASKED TO DELIVER MATERIAL BEYOND CURB LINE,

TERMS NET FOR 30 DAYS — 2% PER MONTH (24% PER YEAR) ON AGCOUNTS OVER 30 DAYS,



Purchase Orders

From: Alex Beckett

Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 2:12 PM
To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Jeff Jasmann

Subject: FW: Price for PO

Attachments: SKM_C25823041110100.pdf

Ariel this is winter handling for driveway stone at Brasseur.

Write this up for Jeff.

Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

¢l Valecraft

Hotmes Lid,

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 219
Mobile: 613-868-8403
www.valecraft.com

From: Chantal <CPatenaude@bedardexcavation.ca>

Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 1:11 PM

To: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>; Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>
Subject: Price for PO

Good Afternoon

Here is attach for Winter handling for stone it's a only a charge from Quarry from December to March. | didn’t sent to
foreman for signature | hope it’s good this way.

Thanks
chantal

Chantal Patenaude

Jacques Bedard Excavation Ltd
Account Receivable

Phone: 613-824-3208 x 205
Fax: 613-824-4321

email; cpatenaude @bedardexcavation.ca

From: bedardexscan@gmail.com
Sent: Tuesday, April 11, 2023 10:11 AM




