Valecraft =™ ™

Homes Ltd.

210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104

Vendor: Ship To:
S & S BOLTON ELECTRIC INC. Site: DEERFIELD VILLAGE PHASE 2
5411 CANOTEK ROAD Lot/Unit: GARBAGE ENCLOSURE B
GLOUCESTER, ONTARIO K1J 9M3 Model:
Civic: TRANQUIAL STREAM PRIVATE
tel: 6137480432
fax: 613-748-0355
contact: CAROL
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Nov 22, 2022 ARIEL S02 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
- QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
E 1360-4200 ELECTRICAL UNDERGROUND, SERVICES, 1.0000| 4,776.900000 4,776.90
ROUGH-IN, FINISH GARBAGE B
) J/ Subtotal 4,776.90
Authorized Signature ' Total Order Value 5,397.90

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceplance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




Purchase Orders

From: Alex Beckett
Sent:

To: Purchase Orders
Subject:

Attachments:

Ariel can you write this PO please as per spreadsheet below.

Thanks
Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

) Valecraft

Homes Lid,

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 219
Mobile: 613-868-8403
www.valecraft.com

From: Richard Beermann <rbeermann@sandselectric.ca>

Sent: Tuesday, November 22, 2022 2:41 PM
To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Tuesday, November 22, 2022 2:46 PM

FW: Quote for 2nd garbage enclosure @ Deerfield
Signed-A7-037-042-S02_SS Electric 2022_CardTrail-DeerField_June-15-2022.pdf

Cc: lan Kolesnik <ikolesnik@valecraft.com>; Carole Roy <croy@sandselectric.ca>; Joshua Worotny

<jworotny@ssholton.com>

Subject: RE: Quote for 2nd garbage enclosure @ Deerfield

Hello Alex

| have reviewed the plans. | see 1 additional pot light has been added.
We can hold our original price — see below taken from attached contract

I
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$1,000.00

$ 2,554.90

$

500.00

| CODE 240 240 240 241 |t

{
"

Rick Beermann

Senior Residential Estimator

S+S Electric, SS Bolton, Orbital Tech Integration
5411 Canotek Road, Ottawa ON K1J 9M3

Cell + 613.229.3871

rbeermann@sandselectric.ca

‘ From: Alex Beckett
<abeckett@valecraft.com>

Sent: November 15, 2022 2:13 PM
To: Kelsey-Lyne Perrier
<kperrier@sandselectric.ca>; Richard

https://link.edqepilot. com/s/40d21b50/aPHP4GCyx00259zaxn0bNg?u=http://www sandselectric.ca/  BEErMann

1



<rbeermann@sandselectric.ca>
Cc: lan Kolesnik <jkolesnik@valecraft.com>
Subject: Quote for 2nd garbage enclosure @ Deerfield

Hi guys, can you provide a quote to do the electrical for the 2" garbage hut at Deerfield please? We’'ll issue a PO.

I think site may have moved the location of the man-door so make sure the electrician adjusts the switch/lighting
location accordingly.

Thanks!

Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

Valecraft

Homes Lud,

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210

Orleans, On K1C 6Z7

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 219

Mobile: 613-868-8403

https:/link.edgepilot.com/s/42f0abd3/wixnFO7wUEmMQgsisGe 39A%u=http://www.valecraft.com/




