‘ ] 1 l t' Purchase Order P0O0002028
Homes (2019) Limited
210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
DUFRESNE FURNITURE Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 5
1901 CYRVILLE ROAD Lot/Unit: LOT 8
OTTAWA, ONTARIO K1B 1A9 Model: 826 STANDARD
Civic: 944 LUCERNE DRIVE
tel: 6138375900 X 1
fax: 613-837-2829
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Nov 15, 2022 ARIEL D37 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
_— QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
z 6600-6500 KING SIZE MATTRESS MODEL #1469793 1.0000 900.000000 900.00
5 6600-6500 SAMSUNG 65" UHD START TV MODEL 1.0000| 1,049.990000 1,049.99
#UNB5AUBO00FXZC
- 6600-6500 ELECTRONICS RECYCLING LEVY 1.0000 24.700000 24.70
Subtotal 1,974.69
/@ HST 256.71
Authorized Signature Total Order Value 2,231.40

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental aclion, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




@ Dufresne

A Better Experience

Completed Invoice #
DUFRESNE - HUNT CLUB y 0436233274
290 WEST HUNT CLUB ROAD  /
UNIT 10 / Order Number Document Date,
OTTAWA ON K2EOB7 0436233274 01/21/22- /
613 723-5666 a5 Oct a2z /
GST #: 86719 3989 RT0001 )
Sold To Ship To
VALECRAFT HOMES 2019 Itd. 1455 , VALECRAFT HOMES
YOUVILLE DR #210 " 944 LUCERNE DRIVE
ORLEANS, ON K1C627 / EMBRUN;- ON"KOATWO
Ce”: /// ’ o L ()\ (,{) Q\ \'\(\(& A ,S i v{)/ Z Q)\\\\
Email: noemail@tdg.ca - \ "
‘Terms ‘ Salesperson Customer # Store
Home: 613 837-1104 ALEX FOURNIER 0413620757 043
Ship Via Remarks: shEt
DOOT1 MODEL HOME, FULL ADDRESS TO BE CONFIRMED.
Ln#|Model/Description Order | Ship Price Amount
1  Model: 1469793 1 1 $900.00 $900.00
SEP YORKE ET KING MATT
KING MATTRESS
2  Model: 1553105 1 1 $1,049.99 $1,049.99
SMG UN65AU8000FXZC 65INCH
PREMIUM 4K UHD SMART
SERIAL #: OBQT3CDRC01122
3 Model: LEVYTV3 1 1 $24.70 $24.70
TV= />46 INCHES
ELECTRONICS RECYCLING LEVY
4  Model: ROOMOFCHOICE 1 1 $0.00 $0.00
ROOM OF CHOICE DELIVERY
SERVICE SELECTED.
Merchandise Subtotal: $1,974.69
National Tax: $98.73
Tax: $157.98
Total Invoice Value: $2,231.40
D3

RECEIVET
0CT 19 2022

Amount 7Due:

$2,231.40




Purchase Orders

From: Valerie Gendron

Sent: Friday, November 11, 2022 12:09 PM

To: Purchase Orders; Frank Nieuwkoop

Subject: FW: Dufresne model home invoice to be approved : TV and king mattress
Hi Ariel,

Here is the approval email.

Val

From: Valerie Gendron

Sent: Thursday, January 6, 2022 3:14 PM

To: Frank Nieuwkoop <frank@valecraft.com>

Subject: RE: Dufresne model home invoice to be approved : TV and king mattress

Thank you, the invoice will be directly send to HO.
Valerie

Valérie Gendron
New Home Sales Assistant / Interior Decorator

Valecraft

Homes (2019) Limited

605 Bruxelles St., Embrun ON KOA 1WO0,
tel (613) 370-0288 | fax (613) 370-0311

valecraft.com

Confidentiality Note: This email may contain confidential and/or private information. If you received this email in error please delete and notify sender.

From: Frank Nieuwkoop <frank@valecraft.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 6, 2022 3:08 PM

To: Valerie Gendron <valerie@valecraft.com>; Diane Brunet <dbrunet@valecraft.com>
Subject: RE: Dufresne model home invoice to be approved : TV and king mattress

Yes good, go ahead

Frank Nieuwkoop
Owner, Vice President



Sylvie Beaucham

From: Alex Fournier <AFournier@dufresne.ca>
Sent: Wednesday, November 2, 2022 10:08 AM
To: Sylvie Beauchamp

Subject: RE: Completion slip

This was for a Matt and TV that was requested, | don’t get completion slips if we don’t install anything. | wouldn’t have
one for this.

ALEX FOURNIER
Ottawa Operations Manager, Dufresne Furniture & Appliances

The Dufresne Group

10-290 West Hunt Club Rd, Ottawa, ON K2EOB7
(613) 723-5666

afournier@dufresne.ca

THE
t DUFRESNE
GROUP

From: Sylvie Beauchamp <sheauchamp@valecraft.com>
Sent: November 1, 2022 7:22 AM

To: Alex Fournier <AFournier@dufresne.ca>

Subject: FW: Completion slip

- - - SRR SEPTS IS et A )

; CAUTION: This e-mail originated from outside TDG/DSG. Do not click any links or buttons, or open any attachments unless you are certain it is safe. If suspicious, please
forward to emailabuse@dufresne.ca

From: Sylvie Beauchamp

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 9:35 AM
To: AFournier@dufresne.ca

Subject: Completion slip

Good morning,

Is it possible to get a completion slip for invoice 04362332747

Thank you and a nice weekend

Sylvie Beauchamp
Accounts Payable



