Val e Craft Purchase Order PO0001923

Homes (2019) Limited
210-1455 Youville Drive

Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104

Vendor: Ship To:
DALMEN PRODUCTS LTD. Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 6
5630 ST-CATHERINE STREET Lot/Unit: BLOCK G35
P.O. BOX 220
Model: 140 REVERSED
ST-ISIDORE, ONTARIO KOC 2B0 Civic: 709 NAMUR STREET
tel: 613-524-2268
fax: 613-524-3070

contactt MARC BELLEFEUILLE 613-858-8017 SBERGEVIN@DALMEN.COM

ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Sep 07, 2022 ARIEL D33 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE D ipti arx UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
escription ORDERED
066-G35-666 CODE 666 REPLACE BROKEN GLASS AT MASTER 1.0000 135.610000 135.61

BEDROOM FIX WINDOW

066-G35-666 CODE 666 SERVICE CHARGE 1.0000 145.000000 145.00

Subtotal 280.61
HST 36.48

7 o
(__—~"  Authorized Signaturé/ Total Order Value 317.09

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS
1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.
4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.
6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

WHITE - ORIGINAL CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE PINK - DEPARTMENT




CREATED: 2022-09-07

l".‘ I . -09-
< a men LAST MODIFICATION: 2022-09-07
Date required: 2022-09-28
Quotation
JOB: S$22-00845 (BLOCK G LOT 35)
SOLD TO: SHIP TO:
VALECRAFT HOMES LTD
VALECRAFT HOMES LTD
1455 YOUVILLE DRIVE
SUITE 210
ORLEANS ONT.
K1C 627
Telephone: (613)837-1104
ID: 994-22870
ITEM |QTY CODE TYPE OF PRODUCT UNRICE
1 1 GLASS Replacement Thermos (485 mm x 978 mm) 135.61 $
_ RECTANGULAR DALMEN
Double Double Thermo Lowe Climaguard Super Spacer Black 80/71 3
mm
389/16" 7/8" (0.875) 22mm TOTAL THICKNESS
== Dalumex Service No Warranty ==
No Warranty
1 Dalumex
— 191/8" —
Frame Size
| TOTAL: 135.61 $
ITEM |QTY CODE TYPE OF PRODUCT U
2 1 SERVICE CHARGE (INSTALLATION) 145.00 $
||
= " —
Frame Size
TOTAL: 145.00 $

** All items are viewed from EXTERIOR. ** Dimensions are width X height

By Mec-Inov inc
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ID: 994-22870
Customer:
Salesman: SUB-TOTAL.: 280.61 $
Service Department
HST (13%) : 36.48
Date: {18%) ?
N/A (0%) : 0.00 $
Terms and conditions:
TOTAL.: 317.09 $
| NET 30 JOURS
THIS QUOTATION IS VALID FOR 30 DAYS
** All items are viewed from EXTERIOR. ** Dimensions are width X height
By Mec-Inov inc PAGE 2/ 2




Purchase Orders

From: Justin Stoll

Sent: Wednesday, September 7, 2022 11:39 AM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Dalmen-condo-screens; Marc Dalmen

Subject: Fwd: PST6 unit G35 broken window

Attachments: image1.jpeg; image2.jpeg; signature%20service.JPG; QUOTATION VALECRAFT BLOCK G
LOT 35.pdf

Hi Ariel,

Can | get a po done for this? Unknown site damage.
Thanks

Justin Stoll
Finishing Foreman

Valecraft 2019
613-809-2654

Begin forwarded message:
From: Service Department <service@dalmen.com>
Date: September 7, 2022 at 11:28:12 AM EDT
To: Justin Stoll <jstoll@valecraft.com>

Cc: Marc Dalmen <mbellefeuille@dalmen.com>
Subject: Re: PST6 unit G35 broken window

Hi,

Attached is the quote to replace the broken thermo.

Please send a PO# if you would like to proceed with the order.
Thank you,

JF

On 2022-09-07 10:03 a.m., Justin Stoll wrote:

Good morning,

| have a broken window in the master bedroom of this unit. Right side fixed glass. Please
send price so | can have po issued. Thanks






SRRSO,




