&) Valec

210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104

Vendor:

3262235 CANADA INC.

o/a FERNANDO DRYWALL ENR.
204-78 GEORGE STREET
OTTAWA, ON K1N 5W1

raft ™

Homes Ltd.

Ship To:
Site:
Lot/Unit:
Model:
Civic:

hase Order PO0051598

DEERFIELD VILLAGE PHASE 2
GARBAGE ENCLOSER

TRANQUIL STREAM PRIVATE

tel: 613-789-0035
fax: 819-772-8998
contact; fernandodrywall@gmail.com
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Jul 21, 2022 ARIEL F18 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
o QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
- 1360-4200 DRYWALL GARBAGE ENCLOUSURE #1 1.0000( 1,100.000000 1,100.00
/
,/A’j_\ Subtotal 1,100.00
m HST 143.00
Authorized Signature Total Order Value 1,243.00

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




Purchase Orders

From: Jeff Jasmann

Sent: Wednesday, June 29, 2022 10:51 AM
To: Purchase Orders

Subject: Fwd: Garbage enlcosure #1 @ Deerfield

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Fernando Drywall <fernandordrywall@gmail.com>
Date: June 29, 2022 at 10:20:32 AM EDT

To: Jeff Jasmann <jjasmann@valecraft.com>

Subject: Fwd: Garbage enlcosure #1 @ Deerfield

Good morning Jeff,
We would need the PO for the garbage enclosure for Block R please.

Thank you

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

De : Fernando Drywall <fernandordrywall@gmail.com>
Date: mar. 28 juin 2022 a 13:54

Subject: Re: Garbage enlcosure #1 @ Deerfield

To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Cc: Stephen Dallaire <sdallaire @valecraft.com>

Hi Alex,

I've been told that the garbage enclosure for Block R has been done but we didn't receive a PO yet. If
you could let me know that would be great.

Thank you

Le mer. 18 mai 2022 a 08:57, Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com> a écrit :

Ok great, thank you.

Alex Beckett

Architectural Manager




%) Valecraft

Homes Ltd,

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627
Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 209

Mobile: 613-868-8403
https://link.edgepilot.com/s/2d674c9b/XL18POjce UW5wuUunzUCMw?u=http://www.valecraft.com/

From: Fernando Drywall <fernandordrywall@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, May 16, 2022 11:39 AM

To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Cc: Stephen Dallaire <sdallaire @valecraft.com>

Subject: Re: Garbage enlcosure #1 @ Deerfield

Hi Alex,

The price to install the 5/8" Type "X" drywa iwwinterior walls only, no ceilings, with one coat of
tape/mud is 1100.00S. /

/

/1 4
/|4
|

Guy will be in touch with Steve about scheduling.
Thanks

Le jeu. 12 mai 2022 a 11:58, Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com> a écrit :

Hello, I should’ve mentioned that it only requires one coat of tape/mud.

Alex Beckett

Architectural Manager



