‘ 7 1 [‘t Purchase Order PO0001657

Y Homes (2019) Limited

210-1455 Youville Drive

Ottawa, On K1C 627

Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:

TRIM IT ALL INC. Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 6

1550 LIVERPOOL COURT, BAY 4 Lot/Unit: BLOCK C

OTTAWA, ON K1B 4L2 .

Model:
Civic: NAMUR STREET

tel: 613-742-8888
fax:

contactt RYAN MARKUT RYAN@TRIMITALL.CA

ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS

May 30, 2022 ARIEL T55 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
e QTY

JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
066-C10-707 CODE 707 SHIPPING FEE BLOCK C10 1.0000 12.500000 12.50
066-C11-707 CODE 707 SHIPPING FEE BLOCK C11 1.0000 12.500000 12.50
066-C12-707 CODE 707 SHIPPING FEE BLOCK C12 1.0000 12.500000 12.50
066-C13-707 CODE 707 SHIPPING FEE BLOCK C13 1.0000 12.500000 12.50
066-C14-707 CODE 707 SHIPPING FEE BLOCK C14 1.0000 12.500000 12.50
066-C15-707 CODE 707 SHIPPING FEE BLOCK C15 1.0000 12.500000 12.50

AT

/__,A_ = 4 Subtotal 409.60
/ V/ 72’\&\/ HST 53.25
™™ Authorized Signaturd, Total Order Value 462.85

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.
6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




' ‘ ] 1 l t‘ Purchase Order PO0001657
Homes (2019) Limited

210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone:  613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
TRIM ITALL INC. Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 6
1550 LIVERPOOL COURT, BAY 4 LovUnit: BLOCK C
OTTAWA, ONK1B 4L2 .

Model:

Civic: NAMUR STREET
tel: 613-742-8888
fax:
contactt RYAN MARKUT RYAN@TRIMITALL.CA

ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. | CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
May 30, 2022 ARIEL T55 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
s QTY

JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
066-C10-666 CODE 666 STANDARD BASEMENT BLOCK C10 2.0000 13.300000 26.60
066-C11-666 CODE 666 STANDARD BASEMENT BLOCK C11 2.0000 13.300000 26.60
066-C12-666 CODE 666 STANDARD BASEMENT BLOCK C12 2.0000 13.300000 26.60
066-C13-666 CODE 666 STANDARD BASEMENT BLOCK C13 2.0000 13.300000 26.60
066-C14-666 CODE 666 STANDARD BASEMENT BLOCK C14 1.0000 13.300000 13.30
066-C15-666 CODE 666 STANDARD BASEMENT BLOCK C15 1.0000 13.300000 13.30
066-C10-666 CODE 666 STANDARD CASING BLOCK C10 3.0000 4.480000 13.44
066-C11-666 CODE 666 STANDARD CASING BLOCK C11 3.0000 4.480000 13.44
066-C12-666 CODE 666 STANDARD CASING BLOCK C12 3.0000 4.480000 13.44
066-C13-666 CODE 666 STANDARD CASING BLOCK C13 3.0000 4.480000 13.44
066-C14-666 CODE 666 STANDARD CASING BLOCK C14 4.0000 4.480000 17.92
066-C15-666 CODE 666 STANDARD CASING BLOCK C15 4,0000 4.480000 17.92
066-C10-666 CODE 666 BB STRIP 1-1/8" BLOCK C10 1.0000 14.000000 14.00
066-C11-666 CODE 666 BB STRIP 1-1/8" BLOCK C11 1.0000 14.000000 14.00
066-C12-666 CODE 666 BB STRIP 1-1/8" BLOCK C12 1.0000 14.000000 14.00
066-C13-666 CODE 666 BB STRIP 1-1/8" BLOCK C13 1.0000 14.000000 14.00
066-C14-666 CODE 666 BB STRIP 1-1/8" BLOCK C14 2.0000 14.000000 28.00
066-C15-666 CODE 666 BB STRIP 1-1/8" BLOCK C15 2.0000 14.000000 28.00

Continued on next page...




Purchase Orders

From: Office Trim it all <office@trimitall.ca>
Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 1:56 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Roger Brunet

Subject: Fwd: Material for block A and C water leak
Ariel,

There was a change made to the list for P.O.# 0001657. We will not be providing the MDF sheets requested for
tomorrow...

Please reflect the amount of the P.O. to be $409.60 plus HST?
Thank you!

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Office Trim it all <office @trimitall.ca>
Date: Mon, May 30, 2022 at 1:53 PM

Subject: Re: Material for block A and C water leak
To: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>

Thank you and sorry for the inconvenience.

On Mon, May 30, 2022 at 1:49 PM Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com> wrote:

Ok please ship all trim items , | will take care of the MDF sheets .

Thanks for the update

Roger Brunet

Consultant

J Valecraft

Homes (2019) Limited

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627
Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206

Mobile: 613-229-4583



https:/link.edgepilot.com/s/8aaadfc7/-dadfJZ MkapBVceFgWI7A?u=http://www.valecraft.com/

From: Office Trim it all <office@trimitall.ca>
Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 1:36 PM

To: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>

Cc: Evan Akins <operations@trimitall.ca>
Subject: Re: Material for block A and C water leak

Mr Brunet,

I'am being informed that we could send the material tomorrow but only in the afternoon.... Please let me know what
you want to do?

If you want to wait until the afternoon, that is great! If not, we will send the baseboards, the casing and the baby strip
on Wednesday.

Thank you!

On Mon, May 30, 2022 at 10:30 AM Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com> wrote:

Can we get the MDF sheets for tomorrow am ?
The rest can wait for Wednesday .
Let me know if possible for the MDF , if not | will pick some up at Rona tomorrow morning

Thanks

Roger Brunet

Consultant




1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206
Mobile: 613-229-4583

hitps:/llink.edgepilot.com/s/3f53708a/|CoBXVQ8RUWGtvYRXwWQVKAu=http://www.valecraft.com/

From: Office Trim it all <office@trimitall.ca>

Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 10:21 AM

To: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>

Cc: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>; Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>; Daniel Guerin
<dguerin@valecraft.com>; Evan Akins <operations@trimitall.ca>

Subject: Re; Material for block A and C water leak

Good morning Ariel!

Tomorrow is fully booked for deliveries and we are already going to Place St-Thomas on Wednesday so | am hoping
that a delivery on Wednesday would be OK on your end?

Here are the prices for P.O.# 0001657:

10 ~ standard baseboard ( 14 ft long ) $133.00

20 — standard casing ( 7 ft long ) or 10 — ( 14ft long ) $89.60

15 — BB strip 1 1/8 inches ( 7ft long ) or 8 — ( 14ft long ) $112.00
10 - 8ft x 12 inch x 5/8 MDF sheets (Priority for Site) $335.00
Shipping 755

Total of $744.60 plus HST.

Regards,



On Mon, May 30, 2022 at 9:43 AM Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com> wrote:

Purchase Order # 0001657 has been temporary written for now, in regards to Material Below. Please provide on-site
for Tomorrow if possible.

Ariel Valdes

Purchasing Assistant

%] Valecraft

Homes L,
210-1455 Youville Drive

Orleans, Ont, K1C 6727

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 220

From: Purchase Orders

Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 9:09 AM

To: 'Office Trim it all' <office@trimitall.ca>

Cc: Daniel Guerin <dguerin@valecraft.com>
Subject: FW: Material for block A and C water leak
Importance: High

Please provide pricing for the following items asap. Will need on site for tomorrow morning if possible.

Ariel Valdes

Purchasing Assistant

Valecraft

g Homes Lud,

210-1455 Youville Drive

Orleans, Ont, K1C 6Z7



Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 220

From: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>

Sent: Monday, May 30, 2022 9:02 AM

To: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>; Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>
Subject: FW: Material for block A and C water leak

Hi Ariel,

Can you please order the following material with Trim It All, we would need on site tomorrow morning if possibie ;
10 - standard basehoard ( 14 ft long )

20 - standard casing { 7 ft long ) or 10 — ( 14ft long )

15— BB strip 1 1/8 inches ( 7ft long ) or 8 — ( 14ft long )

10 — 8ft x 12 inch x 5/8 MDF sheets (Priority for Site)

Material to dropped off in unit B - 08

Let me know thanks

Roger Brunet

Consultant

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627
Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206

Mobile: 613-229-4583



hitps://link.edgepilot.com/s/707c8e51/kpHZafz9PkgHd2Kv316svw?u=htip://www.valecraft.com/

From: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2022 11:07 AM

To: Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com>; Justin Stoll <jstoll@valecraft.com>
Subject: Material for block A and C water leak

Hi guys,

We need the following materials;
1 - roll of poly

1 - roll of tar paper

1 - box of T -50 staples

1 - roll of tape for plastic

1 - box of drywall screws

14 - lengths of baseboard

21 - lengths of casing

21 - lengths of BB strips

14 -8 ft x 12 inch x 5/8 MDF sheet

3 - bag of 24 inch insulation

* need to flip window in C - 15

Planning to start with C-13 on Monday if possible, let me know
Thanks

Roger Brunet
Consultant

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 677
Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206




| Mobile: 613-229-4583
. https://link.edgepilot.com/s/707c8e51/kpHZafz9PkaHd2Kv316svw?u=http://www.valecraft.com/

Kim Langevin
Administration, Trim It All inc
Office: 613-742-8888

hitps:/Mlink.edgepilot.com/s/27ea1c2c/-wDDI6sz90akpMXCOcOW-A?u=hitp://www.trimitall/.ca

Kim Langevin
Administration, Trim It Alt Inc
Office; 613-742-8888

hitps://link.edgepilot.com/s/47fed48e/PUOIgHIRMUOgNF 10zW0P6Q?u=http://www.trimitall/.ca




]

TRIM
IT ALL

Kim Langevin

Administration, Trim It All Inc

Office: 613-742-8888
https://link.edgepilot.com/s/1a437e6e/nKv1BIsQHOBLGQOCDESFEw?u=http://www.trimitall/.ca
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Kim Langevin
Administration, Trim It All Inc
Office: 613-742-8888

https://link.edgepilot.com/s/1a437e6e/nKv1BlsQHOELGQOCDESFEw?u=http://www.trimitall/.ca




