&) Valec

210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627

r ft Purchase Order P0O0051488

Homes Ltd.

Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
MAGENTA EXTERIOR SOLUTIONS INC. Site: DEERFIELD VILLAGE PHASE 2
15 FITZGERALD RD SUITE # 200 Lot/Unit: BLOCK R
NEPEAN, ONTARIO K2H 9G1 .
Model:
Civic: DEARBORN PRIVATE
tel: 613-315-2666
fax:
contactt TROY SAIKALEY TROY@MAGENTACONSTRUCTION.COM
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
May 06, 2022 ARIEL M24 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
o QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
- 1130-0000 RIP & REINSTALL BLOCK R 1.0000| 92,318.290000 92,318.29
N\ 4
) / s //’ Subtotal 92,318.29
HST 12,001.38
A2~
Authorized Signature Total Order Value 104,319.67

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

WHITE - ORIGINAL
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PINK - DEPARTMENT




Magenta Exterior Solutions Inc.

B MAGENTA e

5 GO UTIONG Nepean ON K2H 9G1
2 =) AR
troy@magentaconstruction.com

https://www.magentaconstruction.com
GST/HST Registration No.: 714977535

Estimate
ADDRESS ESTIMATE 1139
VALECRAFT HOMES DATE 30/03/2022

1455 Youville Drive
Orleans Ontario K1C 627

ACTIVITY DESCRIPTION QrYy RATE AMOUNT

Sales Rip and Reinstall 1 92,318.29 92,318.29
Deerfield Village Block R

SUBTOTAL 92,318.29
HST (ON) @ 13% 12,001.38
TOTAL $104,319.67

Accepted By

Accepted Date

Page 1 of 1



VALECRAFT HOMES
1455 Youville Drive

Orleans Ontario KI1C 627

Activity Description Sales Ta oty Rate
Amount

Sales Rip and Reinstall HST ON 1 92,318.29
92,318.29

Deerfield Village

Block R
SubTotal:
92,318.29
Sales Tax Total
12,001.38
Total S
104,319.67
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Rate Tax

HST (ON) @ 13% 12,001.38
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Purchase Orders

From: Alex Beckett

Sent: Friday, May 6, 2022 10:02 AM

To: Purchase Orders

Subject: FW: Estimate 1139 from Magenta Exterior Solutions Inc.
Attachments: Estimate_1139_from_Magenta_Exterior_Solutions_inc.pdf

Ariel, write this PO up for Magenta. Code to back-charge code.

Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

-] Valecraft

Hoties Lid,

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 209
Mobile: 613-868-8403
www.valecraft.com

From: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>

Sent: Friday, May 6, 2022 10:02 AM

To: Paul Therriault <paul@magentaconstruction.com>; Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>
Subject: Fwd: Estimate 1139 from Magenta Exterior Solutions Inc.

It's been forwarded to Alex to provide a PO
Thanks

Roger Brunet
Consultant

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 677

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206
Mobile: 613-229-4583
www.valecraft.com

Begin forwarded message:

From: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>

Date: May 6, 2022 at 9:59:49 AM EDT

To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Cc: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>, Christine Blais <cblais@valecraft.com>
Subject: Fwd: Estimate 1139 from Magenta Exterior Solutions Inc.

Here is the quote for block R re and re
As per Christine PO to reflect back charge code



Thanks

Roger Brunet
Consultant

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On Ki1C 677

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206
Mobile: 613-229-4583
www.valecraft.com

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Magenta Exterior Solutions Inc." <quickbooks@notification.intuit.com>
Date: May 6, 2022 at 9:34:10 AM EDT

To: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>

Subject: Estimate 1139 from Magenta Exterior Solutions Inc.

Reply-To: troy@magentaconstruction.com

Good morning Mr. Brunet,

Here is the estimate for Block R. Feel free to contact us if you have any questions.
We look forward to working with you.

Have a great day,
Magenta Exterior Solutions Inc.

200-15 Fitzgerald Rd

Nepean ON K2H 9G1

+1 613 315 2666
https://link.edgepilot.com/s/e0£8fdc8/f2g0gyMIMUCWMY5yvalU0S7ARu=ht
tps://www.magentaconstruction. com/ )

Estimate #: 1139
Date: 30/03/2022
Exp. Date:

$104,319.67

Address:



