&) Valec

210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627

Phone:

Vendor:

AMcNAMEE CONCRETE CAVANAGH CONCRETE LTD. O

P.O. BOX 244

613-837-1104

156 COUNTY RD 17
SMITHS FALLS, ON K7A 4T1

tet:
fax:
contact:

Homes Ltd.

Ship To:
Site:
Lot/Unit:
Model:
Civic:

TIM CARSON TIM@MCNAMEECONCRETE.COM

I‘ ft Purchase Order

PO0051452

RATHWELL LANDING

LOT 239-270-289

HICKSTEAD WAY & PARADE DRIVE

ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Apr 13, 2022 ARIEL C37 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
JOB/LOTICOST REFERENCE D ipti ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
escription ORDERED
056-239-666 CODE 666 INJECTIONS TO FIX SOME CRACKS IN THE 1.0000 260.000000 260.00
FOUNDATION LOT 239
056-270-666 CODE 666 INJECTIONS TO FIX SOME CRACKS IN THE 1.0000 260.000000 260.00
FOUNDATION LOT 270
056-289-666 CODE 666 INJECTIONS TO FIX SOME CRACKS IN THE 1.0000 260.000000 260.00
FOUNDATION LOT 289
Subtotal 780.00
HST 101.40
/ /Au}%rized Signature Total Order Value 881.40

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel ali or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shalt have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.
6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




Purchase Orders

From: lan Kolesnik

Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 10:29 AM
To: Purchase Orders

Subject: Fwd: Po request

Aerial,

See below for work done by Cavanagh for injections to cracked foundations. Lots 239, 270 and 289.

Thanks,
lan

Begin forwarded message:

From: CCL Service <Service@cavanaghconcrete.ca>
Date: March 30, 2022 at 9:15:46 AM EDT

To: lan Kolesnik <ikolesnik@valecraft.com>

Cc: Dora Rogers <DRogers@cavanaghconcrete.ca>
Subject: Po request

Good morning lan, I am looking for a few po for some work completed to fix some cracks a few weeks
ago. Are you able to send them to Dora and cc myself . Thanks

Mar 8 - 177 hickstead - epoxy injections 260.00S BT 237
PARLDE. DRIVE

Mar 9 - 676 hieksteat~ epoxy injections 260.006 LoT 229

Mar 10 - 751 parade - epoxy injections 260.008 o1 270

Sent from my iPhone




