Homes Ltd.

210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627

&) Valecraft ™™

PO0051304

Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
SSC MAINTENANCE SERVICES INC. Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 1
C-851 NOTRE DAME STREET Lot/Unit: LOT 2
EMBRUN, ONTATIO KOA 1W1 .
Model:
Civic: 605 BRUXELLES STREET
tel: 613-443-7781
fax:
contact: MIKE DESJARDINS MIKE@SSCCLEAN.CA
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Mar 07, 2022 ARIEL S29 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
o QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
= 6600-6200 ONE TIME CLEAN COMPLET AFTER 1.0000 525.000000 525.00
CONSTRUCTION
INCLUDING INSIDE WINDOWS AS WELL
Subtotal 525.00
HST 68.25
Authorized Signature Total Order Value 593.25

2. Theright is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our

WHITE - ORIGINAL CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




Purchase Orders

From: Roger Brunet

Sent: Thursday, March 3, 2022 3:05 PM
To: Mike Desjardins

Cc: Purchase Orders

Subject: Re: 605 Bruxelles Embrun

Great thanks works for me .
Mike | will confirm which day ahead of time .

Ariel, please send a PO to SSC for a one clean at the old model Home phase 1 lot 2,
This needs to be a PO from Valecraft Homes
Thanks

Roger Brunet
Consultant

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 6Z7

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206
Mobile: 613-229-4583
www.valecraft.com

On Mar 3, 2022, at 3:01 PM, Mike Desjardins <mike@sscclean.ca> wrote:

Hello Roger,

Absolutely we can help.

Just a one time clean complete after construction including inside windows as well.
We can clean it for only $525.00 plus taxes if that fits your budget.

Thanks for reaching out.

Mike,

SSC Maintenance Services Inc. /

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 3, 2022, at 2:58 PM, Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com> wrote:

Salut Mike ,



Could you please send us a price to perform one cleaning service , same as you did in
Deerfield.

Would be looking at 3rd week of March , will confirm exact date once minor repairs and
painting is completed
Thanks

Roger Brunet
Consultant

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210

Orleans, On K1C 6Z7

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 206

Mobile: 613-229-4583
https://link.edgepilot.com/s/b30dfa74/svPJ5LNsPEK7Qo7hrOFo2w?u=http://www.valec
raft.com/




