l Homes (201

210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627

Valecraft

9) Limited

Purchase Order

PO0001392

Phone:  613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
ORBITAL Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 5
5411 CANOTEK ROAD Lot/Unit: LOT 8
GLOUCESTER, ONTARIO K1J 9M3 Model: 826
Civic: 944 LUCERNE DRIVE
tel: 6137428211
fax: 613-748-3758
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Feb 01, 2022 ARIEL V03 NET 60 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
" QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
- 6600-6500 2 HOURS LABOUR, 20 FEET RG6U CABLE 1.0000 108.490000 108.49
Subtotal 108.49
HST 14.10
Authorized Signature Total Order Value 122.59

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




www.orbitalti.com

o

orbital

tech integration

Tel: (613) 748-0432
Fax: (613) 748-0355

Shipping address :
944 Lucerne Drive

VALECRAFT HOMES (2019) LTD.

944 Lucerne Drive
Ottawa ON
Canada

Invoice address :

VALECRAFT HOMES (2019) LTD.

VALECRAFT HOMES LTD.
210-1455 Youville Drive

A Division of the S&S Bolton Group
www.ssbolton.com

Customer :

VALECRAFT HOMES (2019) LTD.
VALECRAFT HOMES LTD.
210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans ON K1C 627

Canada

Tel. : 613-837-1104

Fax : 613-837-5901

Orleans ON K1C 627 Origin :
Canada WO-OR02875
Quotation N° SO-OR000967
Your Reference Quotation Date Our Salesperson Payment Terms
WO-OR02875 01/20/2022 Stephanie Murray (OR) Net 30 Days
Description Quantity Unit Price Price
Technician 2.000 Hr 53.00 $ 106.00
[38-34] RG 6 COAX BLACK (305M SPOOL) 6.000 m 0.41 $2.49
Net $ 108.49
Total :
Taxes : $ 14.10
Total : $ 122.59
Net 30 Days

Phone: (613) 748-0432 | Fax: (613) 748-0355 | Email: info@orbitalti.com | Website: www.orbitalti.com

5411 Canotek Road, Ottawa, Ontario K1) 9M3



Purchase Orders

From: Stephanie Murray <smurray@sandselectric.ca>
Sent: Wednesday, January 26, 2022 11:02 AM

To: Purchase Orders; Bob Gervais

Cc: Kirk Richards

Subject: RE: #205058 Lot 8

Attachments: SO-OR000967.pdf

See attached.

Thanks

From: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>

Sent: January 26, 2022 11:00 AM

To: Bob Gervais <bgervais@orbitalti.ca>; Stephanie Murray <smurray@sandselectric.ca>
Cc: Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com>

Subject: RE: #205058 Lot 8

Importance: High

Have yet to receive breakdown for total cost toward Lot 8 in Place St. Thomas Phase 6.

Ariel Valdes
Purchasing Assistant

%] Valecraft

Homes Lid,

210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, Ont, K1C 627

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 220
Fax: 613-837-5901

From: Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 20, 2022 9:37 AM

To: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>; Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>
Subject: Fwd: #205058 Lot 8

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Bob Gervais <bgervais@orbitalti.ca>

Date: January 20, 2022 at 9:36:31 AM EST

To: Stephanie Murray <smurray@sandselectric.ca>
Cc: Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com>
Subject: #205058 Lot 8




Will need a w/o to add tv outlet in den has per valecraft ....

2 hours labour
20 feet RG6u cable



