&) Valec

210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 6Z7

Homes Ltd.

I‘ ft Purchase Order PO0050323

Phone:  613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
THOMAS CAVANAGH CONSTRUCTION Site: RATHWELL LANDING
9094 CAVANAGH ROAD Lot/Unit; LOT 289, LOT 292
ASHTON ON KOA1BO .
Model:
Civic: HICKSTEAD WAY
tel: 6132377030
fax:
contact: MARC LARISEY
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Jun 01, 2021 ARIEL C13 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
. QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
056-289-680 #73 ADDITIONAL WINDOW WELL LOT 289 1.0000 307.000000 307.00
056-292-680 #6 ADDITIONAL WINDOW WELL LOT 292 1.0000 307.000000 307.00
Subtotal 614.00
e HST 79.82
- Authorized Si,qnatL}re Total Order Value 693.82

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. Theright is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




Purchase Orders

From: Darlene MacDonald <DMacdonald@thomascavanagh.ca>
- Sent: Thursday, May 27, 2021 4:21 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Subject: FW: PO Request for Extra Window Wells

Good Afternoon

| am requesting a purchase order for window wells installed at the address’ listed below. | would appreciate if someone
could assist me here for my invoicing.
Thanks,

Darene MacDonald
Residential Contract Admin

PH:613.257.2918 Ext 1222
dmacdonald@thomascavanagh.ca

From: Darlene MacDonald

Sent: Thursday, May 20, 2021 11:34 AM

To: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>
Subject: FW: PO Request for Extra Window Wells

Good Morning Ariel
Will you be able to provide a purchase order for this today?
Thanks,

Darene MacDohaId
Residential Contract Admin

PH:613.257.2918 Ext 1222
dmacdonald@thomascavanagh.ca




From: Darlene MacDonald

Sent: Thursday, May 13, 2021 8:16 AM

To: Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>

Cc: Sundus Al-Sammrai <sundus@valecraft.com>
Subject: PO Request for Extra Window Wells

Good Morning Ariel

I am requesting a PO for Extra window wells installed on May 7/2021 at Rathwell Landing. The Lots which require an
extra are as follows:

Lot 289 177 Hickstead Drive Cost $307.00

Lot 292 171 Hickstead Drive Cost $307.00

| would appreciate if you could please forward the Purchase order to my email address. Please advise if | need to
complete a completion slip for this request.

Thanks,

AW

B

“ @ O L
Darlene MacDonald
Residential Contract Admin

PH:613.257.2918 Ext 1222
dmacdonald@thomascavanagh.ca




