' ‘ 7 1 [ “ Purchase Order PO0049606
Homes Ltd.

210-1455 Youville Drive

Orleans, On K1C 627

Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:

FIREPLACE CENTER & PATIO SHOP Site: RATHWELL LANDING

1722 CARLING AVENUE Lot/Unit: LOT 257

T, QN IS8R 16T Model: 1020 STANDARD

Civic: 724 PARADE DRIVE

tel: 6137281775
fax:
contact:

ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS

Dec 21, 2020 ARIEL F10 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE

o QTY

JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

056-257-666 CODE 666 REPLACE DAMAGE CAP AT GAS 1.0000 175.000000 175.00
FIREPLACE IN GREAT ROOM
Subtotal 175.00
HST 22.75

Authorized Signattre

2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not deliver:
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

ed within the time specified.

Total Order Value

197.75

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

6. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE PINK - DEPARTMENT



Purchase Orders

From: lan Kolesnik

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 10:37 AM

To: Leslie Emmerson

Cc: Purchase Orders; Ipelicos@fireplacecenter.com
Subject: Re: Lot 257--Damaged Cap

Ariel,

Site damage to the cap was caused by unknown so no back charges.

Thanks,
lan

On Dec 10, 2020, at 10:33 AM, Leslie Emmerson <leslieemmerson@fireplacecenter.com> wrote:

HI lan,
| am sending from Webmail as our email is done

the Cost to Replace the damaged cap is $175.00+HST. as we talked about we will do
this Jan 5th 2021

Ariel please send PO

Thanks Leslie

|



