Jasmina Farkas

From: jas uppal <jasuppal@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 3:54 PM

To: Jasmina Farkas

Subject: RE: AVIA 1 #620 returned CHQ

Attachments: image001.jpg; image002.png; image003.png; image004.png
HI JASMINA

PLesae shred this cheque as per my Client’s instructions. Please advise about the new occupancy date if possible.
Thank you.

Sent from Mail for Windows 10

From: Jasmina Farkas
Sent: January 17, 2021 3:53 PM
To: baljitsbassi@gmail.com

Cc: jasuppal@yahoo.com
Subject: AVIA 1 #620 returned CHQ

Good afternoon,

Please see attached copy of the cheque you provided and which was returned to us by the builder’s lawyers as we do
not collect occupancy deposit cheques at this time. Please advise if you want to come pick it up or if | can shred it. Thank
you.

Kind regards,

JASMINA FARKAS
SITE ADMINISTRATOR

PARKSIDE
VILLAGE.

MIS51I55AUGCA

465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST
MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B OE3
T.905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772

LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM
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