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Jasmina Farkas

From: Jasmina Farkas
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 4:50 PM
To: Adil Yousuf
Subject: RE: AVIA 2 #603 - replaced CHQ

Thank you very much. The cheque is void and shredded now.  
 

 
 
From: Adil Yousuf [mailto:adil.yousuf.kalani@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 3:29 PM 
To: Jasmina Farkas <jasmina@lifeatparkside.com> 
Subject: Re: AVIA 2 #603 - replaced CHQ 
 
Pls shred it and send over a confirmation, thx 
 
On Wed, Jan 20, 2021 at 3:09 PM Jasmina Farkas <jasmina@lifeatparkside.com> wrote: 

Good afternoon, 
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You replaced this deposit CHQ with three other CHQs but I still have this old one (as per attachment). Please advise if 
you would like me to shred it or if you would like to pick it up. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Kind regards, 

  

JASMINA FARKAS 

SITE ADMINISTRATOR 

  

 

  

465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST 

MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B 0E3  

T. 905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772 

LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM 
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