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Jasmina Farkas

From: mohammad jaffal <m1-jaffal@hotmail.ca>
Sent: Sunday, January 17, 2021 10:45 AM
To: Raafat Metwaly; Jasmina Farkas
Subject: Re: Avia 2 2106 - 

Hi just go ahead and shred it  
 Thank you   
Get Outlook for Android 
 

From: Jasmina Farkas <jasmina@lifeatparkside.com> 
Sent: Sunday, January 17, 2021 10:14:03 AM 
To: Raafat Metwaly <raafat@raafat.ca> 
Cc: mohammad jaffal <m1-jaffal@hotmail.ca> 
Subject: FW: Avia 2 2106 -  
  
Good morning, 
  
You replaced this deposit but I still have this cheque with me – please see attached and advise if you would like me to 
return it to you or if I can shred it. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Kind regards, 
  
JASMINA FARKAS 
SITE ADMINISTRATOR 
  

 
  
465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST 
MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B 0E3  
T. 905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772 
LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM 

     
  
  
  
From: Jasmina Farkas  
Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2020 10:47 AM 
To: Raafat Metwaly <raafat@raafat.ca> 
Cc: mohammad jaffal <m1-jaffal@hotmail.ca> 
Subject: Avia 2 2106 - chq correction needed 
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Good morning, 
  
Please see attached scanned copy of the cheque provided by Mohammad A Jaffal, unit 2106, which was not processed 
and it was returned to us because the numerical amount written on the cheque and the amount written on the cheque 
do not correspond. Also the cheque is not dated.  
  
Could you please arrange a replacement as soon as possible? Thank you. 
  
Kind regards, 
  
JASMINA FARKAS 
SITE ADMINISTRATOR 
  

 
  
465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST 
MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B 0E3  
T. 905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772 
LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM 
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Jasmina Farkas

From: Jasmina Farkas
Sent: Sunday, January 17, 2021 10:14 AM
To: Raafat Metwaly
Cc: mohammad jaffal
Subject: FW: Avia 2 2106 - 
Attachments: SKM_554e20081110180.pdf

Good morning, 
 
You replaced this deposit but I still have this cheque with me – please see attached and advise if you would like me to 
return it to you or if I can shred it. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards, 
 
JASMINA FARKAS 
SITE ADMINISTRATOR 
 

 
 
465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST 
MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B 0E3  
T. 905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772 

LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM 

     

 
 
 
From: Jasmina Farkas  
Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2020 10:47 AM 
To: Raafat Metwaly <raafat@raafat.ca> 
Cc: mohammad jaffal <m1-jaffal@hotmail.ca> 
Subject: Avia 2 2106 - chq correction needed 
 
Good morning, 
 
Please see attached scanned copy of the cheque provided by Mohammad A Jaffal, unit 2106, which was not processed 
and it was returned to us because the numerical amount written on the cheque and the amount written on the cheque 
do not correspond. Also the cheque is not dated.  
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Could you please arrange a replacement as soon as possible? Thank you. 
 
Kind regards, 
 
JASMINA FARKAS 
SITE ADMINISTRATOR 
 

 
 
465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST 
MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B 0E3  
T. 905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772 

LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM 

     

 




